
anufacture
Mfg. Part 
number Description Unit En Pointe KTM Convergint Black Box Anixter Accu-tech

Belden 24567915 Cat6 Plenum Data Cable
1000ft.b

ox $370.38 $391.47 $501.07 $390.06 $292.00 $307.00

Belden 639948 RG-6 plenum coaxial cable for CATV
1000ft.b

ox $664.35 $805.82 $905.46 $760.00 $604.00 $576.00
Chatsworth 10250-718 18"x9' Cable runway-ladder rack EA $90.61 $97.38 $123.49 $105.84 $87.00 $84.00
Chatsworth 55053-703 7'x196" black aluminum relay rack EA $129.34 $135.62 $181.75 $147.41 $119.00 $190.00
Chatsworth 12730-718 Rack to runway plate for 18" runway EA $34.12 $40.57 $46.51 $39.86 $32.55 $34.00
Chatsworth 11421-718 Wall angle support for 18" runway EA $23.80 $26.23 $32.43 $27.79 $22.75 $23.00
Chatsworth 11312-718 Triangular support bracket for 18" runway EA $56.22 $61.96 $76.62 $65.68 $53.00 $53.00
Chatsworth 10595-712 Rack to runway plate for 12" runway EA $28.60 $31.52 $40.18 $33.40 $27.25 $28.00
Chatsworth 11421-712 Wall angle support for 12" runway EA $20.80 $22.93 $29.23 $24.30 $19.85 $20.00
Chatsworth 10250-712 12"x9' Cable runway-ladder rack EA $79.21 $85.13 $111.31 $92.53 $75.51 $77.00
Chatsworth 11961-718 wall mount rack 36"x19"x18" EA $234.39 $283.14 $319.46 $273.83 $217.67 $23.00

Corning 002E58-31331-2 SM Two fiber zipcord plenum cable
500' 
spool $170.00 $124.28 $228.38 $140.00 $92.00 $115.00

Corning 002K58-31341-2 62.5/125 Two fiber zipcord plenum cable
500' 
spool $225.00 $174.31 $304.14 $195.00 $140.00 $150.00

Corning 002S58-31380-2 50/125 Two fiber zipcord plenum cable
500' 
spool $340.00 $143.04 $466.30 $155.00 $240.00 $302.00

Chatsworth 10622-010 grounding busbar EA $95.66 $110.50 $134.43 $111.75 $89.76 $93.00
Corning FAN-BT25-12 25" 12 fiber fan-out kit EA $15.71 $17.79 $21.41 $18.34 $13.00 $15.00
Corning 24EW4-T4101D224 strand 8.3/125 SM Altos OSP cable FT $0.41 $0.46 $0.56 $0.63 $0.37 $0.39
Corning 24CW4-T4131D224 strand 50/125 MM Altos OSP cable FT $0.23 $2.01 $0.93 $2.82 $1.56 $1.80
Corning 95-101-41-SP SC 62.5/125 MM connector EA $227.64 $4.84 $5.91 $5.19 $3.91 $4.70
Corning 95-201-41-SP SC 8.3/125 SM connector EA $8.15 $9.12 $11.11 $9.78 $7.05 $8.70
Corning 1101045-01 Epoxy/primer/injector kit EA $53.08 $57.93 $72.35 $62.01 $53.00 $51.00
Corning 2104072-01 White lapping film EA $88.68 $94.35 $120.87 $101.03 $75.00 $82.00
Corning 2104004-01 Grey lapping film EA $48.24 $51.31 $65.74 $54.94 $41.00 $45.00
Corning 95-000-40 Unicam SC MM termination EA $9.26 $9.80 $12.61 $10.65 $8.15 $8.75
Corning 95-200-41 Unicam SC SM termination EA $14.81 $15.67 $20.18 $17.04 $13.00 $14.00
Panduit FSCMC5BL SC Opticam 50/125 MM termination EA $13.04 $13.89 $17.78 $15.10 $11.50 $11.25
Panduit FSCMC6BL SC Opticam 62.5/125 MM termination EA $12.72 $13.89 $17.34 $15.10 $11.50 $11.25

 Commonly Used Parts Vendor price comparison



Panduit FSCSCBU SC Opticam SM termination EA $14.82 $15.79 $17.34 $16.05 $13.15 $13.45
Loctite 7649 Primer for epoxy polish connectors EA no bid no bid $20.20 $17.28 $66.95 $13.00
Loctite 680 Adhesive for epoxy polish connectors EA no bid no bid $394.57 $22.30 $25.00 $15.75
Corning 2104254-01 Fiber cleaning cassette for SC, ST, and LC EA $289.50 $327.96 $19.12 $322.48 $237.18 $264.00
Panduit FLCSMC5BLY LC Opticam 50/125 MM termination EA $14.03 $14.77 $19.12 $16.05 $11.65 $11.25
Panduit FLCSMC6BLY LC Opticam 62.5/125 MM termination EA $14.03 $14.77 $20.58 $16.05 $11.65 $11.25
Panduit FLCSSCBUY LC Opticam SM termination EA $15.10 $15.89 $0.36 $17.28 $12.50 $18.45

Panduit FMCBT2BL-X 2.0MM boots for fiber connectors
bag of 

10 $2.10 $0.22 $42.74 $0.24 $1.95 $1.80
Erico 611255 5' copper 1/2" grounding rod EA $7.80 $10.41 $14.25 $11.31 $6.39 $3.00

CATV F-connectors crimp style for RG-6 cab
bag of 

50 $35.00 $35.08 $1.33 $119.00 $15.30 $14.33
Panduit CJ6X88TGBU Cat6a jacks-blue EA $11.40 $12.36 $15.53 $12.71 $9.25 $9.35
Panduit CJ688TGBU Cat6 jacks-blue EA $8.25 $8.74 $11.24 $8.98 $6.25 $6.30
Panduit CJ688TGOR Cat6 jacks-orange EA $8.25 $8.74 $11.24 $8.98 $6.25 $6.30
Panduit CMFBL CATV inserts-black EA $4.08 $4.21 $5.56 $8.98 $3.25 $3.60
Panduit CMFWH CATV inserts-white EA $4.08 $4.21 $5.56 $4.31 $3.25 $3.60
Panduit CFPE6WH 6-port faceplates-white EA $1.88 $2.05 $2.57 $2.23 $1.60 $1.70
Panduit CFPE4WH 4-port faceplates-white EA $1.88 $2.05 $2.57 $2.23 $1.60 $1.70
Panduit CF1064IG 4-port floor frame-gray EA $1.62 $1.76 $2.20 $1.91 $1.36 $1.40
Panduit CFFPL4BL 4-port furniture faceplates EA $2.15 $2.35 $2.93 $2.55 $1.81 $1.75
Panduit CPPL48WBL 48-port Patch Panels EA $46.82 $49.70 $63.82 $54.03 $38.00 $39.00
Panduit CPPA72FMWBLY72-port Patch Panels EA $112.17 $119.06 $152.88 $129.41 $93.00 $92.00

Panduit CMBWH-X blank port insert- white
bag of 

10 $5.00 $2.07 $0.29 $0.23 $1.80 $1.80

Panduit CMBBL-X blank port insert-black
bag of 

10 $5.00 $2.07 $0.29 $0.23 $1.80 $1.80
Panduit WMPF1E Horiz. wire manager-2RU front only EA $41.07 $44.14 $55.97 $47.98 $33.69 $38.00
Panduit WMPV45E Vert. wire manager-7'h, 4"w front and rear EA $192.87 $207.29 $262.86 $225.31 $163.00 $165.00
Panduit WMPV22E Vert. wire manager-22 RMU front and rear EA $97.81 $105.12 $133.31 $114.26 $82.00 $78.00
Panduit WMPVCBE center mount kit for vert wire mgt EA $8.43 $9.06 $11.49 $9.85 $6.91 $6.75
Panduit JP2W-L20 J-hooks w/ ceiling wire clip 50/box $184.26 $106.09 $125.58 $100.83 $71.00 $85.00
Panduit JP2WP-L20 J-hooks w/ wall mount bracket 50/box $184.11 $106.01 $125.48 $100.83 $75.00 $70.00
Panduit CICZC2X2 Zone cabling box 2'X2' EA $1,048.00 $1,047.40 $1,429.17 $1,138.48 $800.00 $800.00
Panduit GPKBW144 Cat6 110 punchdown block with legs kit EA $58.00 $57.73 $79.06 $62.75 $44.62 $43.50



Panduit P110KB1004 Cat5e 110 punchdown block with legs kit EA $23.57 $23.46 $32.13 $25.50 $18.15 $17.75
Panduit JBX3510WH-A Single gang surface mount junction box-white EA $4.16 $4.63 $5.67 $4.86 $3.60 $3.70
Panduit LD10WH8-A 8' Latching raceway- white EA $2.28 $2.53 $3.11 $21.20 $15.00 $1.85
Panduit FWME8 wall mount fiber enclosure EA $151.84 $161.78 $206.95 $175.85 $124.00 $120.00
Jetline PL232B 6500' 200lb tensile strength pull string in a bu EA no bid $48.25 $41.18 $37.50 $25.00 $47.00

Panduit PLT4S-C 14" cable ties Pkg/100 $31.51 $34.74 $42.95 $36.81 $26.00 $30.00

Panduit PLT3S-C702Y halar cable ties 11.6 in-100 count Pkg/100 $180.83 $194.35 $246.46 $205.98 $144.00 $148.00
Panduit UTPSP3BUY Cat6 3ft patch cable-blue EA $7.37 $7.82 $10.05 $8.21 $5.70 $5.75
Panduit UTPSP5BUY Cat6 5ft patch cable-blue EA $7.97 $8.46 $10.86 $8.88 $6.25 $6.25
Panduit UTPSP7BUY Cat6 7ft patch cable-blue EA $8.59 $9.12 $11.71 $9.56 $6.70 $6.50
Panduit UTPSP10BUY Cat6 10ft patch cable-blue EA $9.51 $10.10 $12.96 $10.60 $7.45 $7.25
Panduit UTPSP20BUY Cat6 20ft patch cable-blue EA $12.41 $13.18 $16.92 $13.83 $9.73 $9.25
Panduit UTPSP7 Cat6 7ft patch cable- off-white EA $8.59 $9.12 $11.71 $9.56 $6.73 $6.50

Panduit CIPOR-C Telephone icon for TX jacks Pkg/100 $10.06 $9.32 $13.71 $10.13 $7.21 $9.00
Siemon FT-CKIT-L2 Anaerobic consumables kit for fiber terminatio EA $302.93 $307.53 $412.87 $331.76 $267.88 $250.00

Spec. Tech FS200 2" wall penetration w/ firestop putty EA $31.17 $37.94 $42.48 $35.05 $29.00 $29.00
15ft. RJ-11 to RJ-45 SS telephone cable EA $4.61 no bid $5.73 $2.32 $4.25 $4.45
20ft. RJ-11 to RJ-45 SS telephone cable EA $5.50 no bid $6.56 $2.68 $4.75 $5.50
6 gauge grounding cable FT $0.60 $0.44 $0.66 $0.80 $0.40 $0.50

 Panduit  CX225-56-Q #4 copper grounding lug screw-dwn NO CRIM EA $463.90 $7.58 $5.31 $824.33 $7.32 $7.25

anufacture
Mfg. Part 
number Description Unit

Brother PT-1400 Label printer EA $108.34 $157.14 $147.66 $170.80 $105.00 $110.00
Ideal 35-518 19-Piece Master Electrician's hole saw kit EA $236.84 $402.09 $322.80 $259.39 $202.45 $200.00

Brother TZ-221 Black On White label Tape, 3/8" x 26.2' EA $11.03 $14.04 $15.04 $12.96 $10.50 $14.00
Fiskars 94857097 Fiskars datacomm scissors EA no bid $14.65 $18.96 $15.93 $19.26 $30.00
Fluke DTX-PLA002S Cat6A/Class E Permanent Link Adapter set o EA $821.39 $905.43 $1,119.49 $952.43 $719.00 $800.00
Fluke FT120 Fiberviewer Microscope 200x with safety filte EA $403.70 $428.32 $550.21 $450.55 $332.00 $351.00
Fluke FT525 FiberInspector mini and cleaning kit EA $1,706.78 $1,810.87 $2,326.22 $1,904.85 $1,389.29 $1,600.00

Greenlee 438-2X 25' fishtape w/ crank handle EA $11.83 $14.79 $16.13 $13.45 $10.80 $11.00

Tools



Ideal 33-750 RJ-45/RJ-11 Crimper/stripper set EA $97.54 $160.92 $132.94 $118.70 $94.00 $84.00
Crain Ent. 90520 22' Gopher Pole EA $144.45 $193.43 $196.88 $164.33 $130.12 $165.00

Tempo 8662 Tracker II underground cable locator EA no bid $941.93 $1,208.96 $835.95 $700.00 $825.00
Greenlee 45655 Fiber Optic hand tools kit EA $878.74 $1,104.26 $1,197.66 $975.23 $756.55 $925.00
Greenlee 34757 1/2" - 2" knockout kit EA $300.10 $347.66 $408.33 $348.80 $268.95 $300.00
Greenlee 2815 2-1/2" - 4" knockout kit EA $901.07 $1,233.26 $1,228.09 $1,000.01 $761.92 $100.00
Greenlee 35884 Kwik Stepper step bit kit EA $132.71 $167.89 $180.88 $151.23 $116.00 $120.00

lowest price
no bid
lowest price, but not consistant with others


