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Uni-ball Gel Grip Pen-Med. Point No Bid $1.35 16.19/dz $0.78 $0.85 $0.30 $0.70 8.46/dz $1.23 $0.33 $1.37 16.49/dz
Writing Pads, 81/2 x 11 3/4 No Bid $0.62 7.46/dz $1.49 $1.50 $0.50 NO BID $0.66 7.94/dz $1.82 $0.58 No Bid $0.61 7.29/dz

Writing Pads, 81/2 x 14 No Bid $12.77 $2.28 $2.00 $0.50 NO BID $0.73 8.78/dz $2.73 No Bid $1.08 13.00/dz
Prem. Writing Pads 81/2x113/4 No Bid $2.68 10.70/4pk $1.61 $0.50 5.99/dz $2.00 NO BID $0.66 7.94/dz No Bid $2.58 30.99/dz

Prem. Writing Pads 81/2x14 No Bid $2.85 $0.72 8.69/dz $2.00 NO BID $0.73 8.78/dz No Bid $3.75 44.99/dz
Phone Message Bk., 200/book No Bid $3.95 $1.72 20.64/dz $3.30 $2.30 NO BID $3.65 No Bid $1.29 15.48/dz

Post It Notes 1 1/2x2 $5.21 $3.86 $1.20 $4.50 $1.23 NO BID $1.03 No Bid No Bid $2.20
Post It Notes 3x3 No Bid $4.72 9.44/dz $4.44 .74ea $1.26 .21ea $5.40 $2.10 NO BID $3.40 No Bid $2.28 4.50/dz
Post It Notes 3x5 No Bid $6.74 16.19/dz $4.45 1.09/ea $1.65 .33/ea $5.00 $1.50 NO BID $1.75 4.19/dz No Bid $2.90 7.00/dz

Message Flags, Sign here $5.75 NO BID $1.64 3.28/2pk $1.00 NO BID $3.83 No Bid No Bid $3.00 5.99/2pk
Single-line Correction Tape $3.32 $1.69 $0.82 $1.70 NO BID 10.14/pk No Bid $3.49

Write Out Correction Fluid-White $1.61 $0.70 $0.92 $0.60 NO BID $0.39 4.69/dz No Bid $1.21 14.49/dz
Uni-ball Gel Rollerball Pen/black No Bid $2.17 26.09/dz $1.39 $1.45 $0.35 NO BID $0.66 7.92/dz No Bid $2.09
Flexgrip Retractable Pen/black No Bid $0.79 $0.89 $0.55 NO BID $0.40 4.83/dz No Bid $1.85 22.20/dz

Soft Feel Ballpoint/black No Bid $0.64 7.64/dz $0.27 $0.43 NO BID $0.40 4.83/dz No Bid $0.65 7.79/dz
Round Stic Ballpoint/black No Bid $0.15 1.79/dz $0.08 $0.06 0.73/dz $0.11 $0.01 0.09/dz NO BID $0.07 .84/dz No Bid $0.12 1.49/dz

Office Prod. Stick Pen/med/blk $1.43 $0.99 $0.73 $1.07 $0.75 NO BID $0.07 .84/dz No Bid $1.39
Sharpwriter Pencil, .7mm No Bid $0.34 4.13/dz $0.25 $0.30 NO BID $0.19 2.29/dz No Bid $0.32 3.79/dz

Am. Pencil #2med. Soft lead No Bid $0.98 $0.65 $0.63 $1.02 $0.60 NO BID $0.66 No Bid $1.59
Hi-Liter Desk-Style, Asst. No Bid $2.75 4.13/6pk $1.79 $2.00 $2.00 NO BID $4.25 No Bid $4.00

Hi-Liter, Flourescent Yellow $0.80 $0.34 $0.29 $0.40 $0.28 NO BID $0.21 2.53/dz No Bid $0.65 7.79/dz $0.35
Sharpie Fine Point Black Marker $6.26 $6.59 $2.64 .22/ea $6.60 $3.00 NO BID $4.54 $8.01 $3.40 $8.04

Super Sharpie Marker, Black No Bid $1.35 16.19/dz $0.87 $0.90 NO BID $0.38 4.52/dz $1.24 $1.67 19.99/dz
Marks-o-Lot Markers, Black $8.99 $5.49 $3.48 .29/ea $6.20 $2.25 NO BID $7.59 $3.67 $9.99

Recycle Manila Folder/Ltr.100/bx $17.99 $7.72 $4.99 $12.00 $7.50 NO BID $7.50 $18.90 $7.39 $20.99
Recycle Manila Folder/Leg.100/bx $20.60 $10.84 $6.84 $14.50 $8.00 NO BID $10.28 $23.25 $12.82 $23.99

Hanging File Folders Let.25/bx No Bid $13.40 $6.62 $5.24 $7.30 $6.50 NO BID $6.64 $10.24 $6.80 No Bid $16.49
Hanging File FoldersLeg.25/bx No Bid $15.38 $9.99 $6.83 $9.50 $5.00 NO BID $8.13 $14.85 $9.24 No Bid $17.49
White Laser Label,Address 1X4 No Bid $19.99 $7.65 $23.89 $12.00 NO BID $29.23 $18.24 No Bid $27.99
White Laser Label, Ship 3 1/2 X5 $30.59 $19.56 $25.50 $11.00 NO BID $19.10 $31.05 $37.99
Remov. Laser File Folder Labels $21.32 $12.49 $10.00 $3.50 NO BID $10.10 $17.35 $22.49
Remov.Ink Jet File Folder, White $22.49 $14.39 $10.00 $8.50 NO BID $11.34 $19.79 $24.49
Recyc.KraftClasp Env. #55,6X9 No Bid $12.50 $5.62 $4.98 $8.75 $7.00 NO BID $6.54 $10.46 $10.08 No Bid $8.00

" " " "  #93, 9 1/2 X 12 1/2 No Bid $19.79 $8.49 $12.54 $10.50 NO BID $9.68 $15.02 $13.61 No Bid $15.49
" " " " #97, 10 X 13 No Bid $16.91 $8.44 $6.99 $12.30 $9.00 NO BID $9.29 $14.67 $9.26 No Bid $13.99

" " " " #110, 12 X 15 1/2 No Bid $30.32 $11.95 $10.27 $14.50 $11.50 NO BID $14.00 $22.86 $18.20 No Bid $24.99
Invisible Tape, 1/2" x 1296" $2.24 $1.65 $0.52 $1.75 10.5/6pk $3.90 3.9/6pk NO BID $2.10 12.60/6pk $0.86 5.16/6pk $2.05
Invisible Tape, 3/4" X 1296" $2.24 $1.85 $0.63 $2.10 12.6/6pk $1.00 6/6pk NO BID $2.45 14.73/6pk $1.09 6.54/6pk $2.25

1/4" Sharp Point Staples/5000 $2.96 $0.55 $0.50 $0.60 $1.00 NO BID $0.32 .95/pk $0.96 $0.63 $2.29
Paper Clips, NO. 1 Reg. 100/bx No Bid $2.42 $2.10 $1.60 .16/bx $2.10 $1.75 NO BID $1.55 $2.54 $1.54 $2.89 $2.50 0.25/ea

Paper Clips, Jumbo 100/bx No Bid $6.20 $6.30 $3.90 0.39/bx $6.50 $4.00 NO BID $4.24 $7.60 $4.76 $9.79 $6.00 0.60/ea
Binder Clips, Mini 9/16", 12/bx No Bid $0.62 $0.38 $0.23 $0.40 $0.23 NO BID $0.13 .67/pk $0.47 $0.26 $0.79
Binder Clips, Small 3/4", 12/bx No Bid $1.16 $0.38 $0.23 $0.40 $0.30 NO BID $0.21 2.47/pk $0.47 $0.29 $0.79 $0.59
Binder Clips, Med. 1-14", 12/bx No Bid $1.84 $0.95 $0.54 $0.90 $0.75 NO BID $2.09 $1.08 $0.71 $1.99 $1.19
Binder Clips, Large 2", 12/bx No Bid $5.21 $2.53 $1.37 $2.60 $1.50 NO BID $6.11 $3.10 $1.73 $3.89 $2.89

45 Black Inkjet Cartridge $31.49 $26.99 $29.00 $8.50 NO BID $59.12 $33.63 $11.85 $32.99
78 Tri-Color Inkjet Cart,High Yield $54.89 $49.99 $53.00 $18.99 NO BID $42.17 $62.36 $24.29 $57.99

Hev Dty Bx Sealing Tape 2"X55yds No Bid $3.43 20.60/6pk $2.57 $0.86 5.13/6pk $2.60 NO BID $1.61 38.55/24pk $3.15 $6.29 $5.50
Box Sealing Tape Dispenser No Bid $8.99 $3.27 $1.50 NO BID $4.00 $7.19
Staples,210 Strip ct. 5000/bx No Bid $1.25 $0.59 $0.50 $1.00 NO BID $0.29 .86/pk $0.63 $0.99 $0.75

Calculator paper 21/4"X150ft/12roll No Bid $10.61 $6.83 $5.04 0.42/rl $7.00 NO BID $4.90 $8.37 $8.19 $7.20 0.60/rl
Man.folder,1Ply top tab,1/3 cut No Bid $11.51 $7.66 $6.84 $8.00 NO BID $9.30 $9.38 $8.39

Hang folder, green, Leg./1/3 cut No Bid $12.68 $7.55 $6.83 $7.00 NO BID $7.35 $9.24 $8.99
Hang folder, green, Let./1/3 cut No Bid $9.26 $5.50 $5.24 $8.50 NO BID $6.01 $6.80 $8.00

JawStyle Staple Remover, Brown No Bid $0.80 $0.41 $0.39 $0.25 NO BID $0.17 $0.45 $0.60
Rubber Bands,Sz. 64, 1/4 lb.Bx No Bid $1.05 0.73/bg $1.08 NO BID $0.39 1.54/bg $1.29 $1.69
Rubber Bands,Sz. 32, 1/4 lb.Bx No Bid $1.05 0.73/bg $1.08 NO BID $0.39 1.54/bg $1.29 $1.69

Shrpwrtr Pencil, #2 non-refillable No Bid $0.34 4.13/dz $0.25 $0.30 NO BID $2.29 $0.30 $0.13 $0.32 3.79/dz
1" Core Sp.Sav. Tape Dispenser No Bid $5.39 $1.89 $1.42 $2.25 $1.50 NO BID $1.57 $2.96 $1.08 $3.40

ITEM DESCRIPTION Quill
Perry Office 

Plus
Quick 

Delivery Office Max Wilton's
Flatt 

Stationers
AMOUNT FOR PROFIT TO BE ADDED TO

VENDORS NET COST N/A N/A N/A 5% 9% 0%

PERCENTAGE OFF NON-CONTRACTED 
ITEMS IN THE BIDDERS CATALOG 10% 45% 4% 5% 9% n/a

DELIVER DATE TO BE DELIVERED 
AFTER ORDER IS PLACED 1-3 DAYS NEXT BUSINESS DAY 1-2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS NEXT BUSINESS DAY 2-5 DAYS

WORKERS COMPENSATION YES YES YES YES YES YES

COMPREHENSIVE GENERAL LIABILITY YES YES YES YES YES YES

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY INS. YES YES YES YES YES YES

CAN YOU PROVIDE US WITH 
CATALOGS FOR EACH DEPARTMENT 

AT NO COST?
YES YES YES YES YES YES

    Court Approval:____________________________________________________________   Approval Date:____________________


