
Type Of 
Vehicle

# of 
Vehicles

Estimated 
# of Yearly 

Oil 
Changes

Price of Castrol 
Oil Change & 14 

point Check

Price of Oil 
Change

Brand of Oil 
Filter

Total Estimated 
Cost for Yearly 

Oil Changes

1995 Ford Van 1 6 $33.61 $6.20 Mighty $238.86 

1996 Dodge Van 1 6 $31.70 $6.20 Mighty $227.40 

1996 Dodge 
Pickup

3 18 $31.70 $6.20 Mighty $682.20 

1997 Dodge Ram 
Van

1 6 $31.70 $6.20 Mighty $227.40 

1998 Chevrolet 
Auto mini- Van

1 6 $31.70 $11.50 Mighty $259.20 

1998 Ford 3 Dr. 
Ext. Van

1 6 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $242.34 

1998 Ford Van 1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

1999 Dodge 
Maxi-Wagon Van 

3500
1 6 $33.11 $6.20 Mighty $235.86 

1999 Ford 
Econoline

1 6 $34.81 $7.28 Mighty $252.54 

1999 Lincoln 
Navigator

1 6 $34.81 $7.28 Mighty $252.54 

2000 Chevrolet 
3/4 Ton Pickup

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2000 Ford 
Crown Vic

4 24 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $969.36 

2000 Chevrolet 
3/4 ton Pick Up

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2000 Bus 
International

2 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2001 Ford ½ ton 
Ranger Pickup

1 6 $31.70 $8.30 Mighty $240.00 

2001 E350 club 
Wagon Van

1 6 $34.81 $7.28 Mighty $252.54 

2001 Ford F150 
Pickup

1 6 $34.81 $11.50 Mighty $277.86 

2002 Ford 
Crown Vic.

3 18 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $727.02 

2002 Ford F150 
Ext. Cab Pickup

1 6 $34.81 $11.50 Mighty $277.86 

2002 Ford E150 
Club Wagon

1 6 $34.81 $7.28 Mighty $252.54 
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2002 Windstar 
Cargo Van

1 6 $31.57 $11.50 Mighty $258.42 

2002 Ford 15 
Passenger Club 

Wagon
1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2003 Ford 
Crown Vic.

3 18 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $802.98 

2003 Chevrolet 
Truck S10

1 6 $31.57 $7.49 Mighty $234.36 

2003 Ford Truck 
F 150 Extended 

Cab
2 12 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $535.32 

2003 E350 Van 1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2004 Chevrolet 
Blazer

1 6 $31.57 $6.20 Mighty $226.62 

2004 Ford F150 
Ext. Cab

1 6 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $273.96 

2004 Ford Van 
Econoline

1 6 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $273.96 

2004 Dodge 
Dakota Truck

1 6 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $273.96 

2004 Ford 
Crown Vic.

5 30 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $1,211.70 

2004 Ford Van 
E350

1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2005 Ford 
Crown Vic.

7 42 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $1,696.38 

2005 Ford 
Explorer XL

2 12 $31.70 $10.15 Mighty $502.20 

2005 Ford 
Explorer XLS 

4x2
2 12 $31.70 $10.15 Mighty $502.20 

2005 Ford Truck 
F 150  

1 6 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $273.96 

2005 Ford 250 
Truck

1 6 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $273.96 

2005 Dodge 
Truck Ram 1500

1 6 $34.81 $7.28 Mighty $252.54 

2005 Dodge 
Grand Caravan 

1 6 $31.57 $10.85 Mighty $254.52 

2006 Ford 
Econoline E

1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2006 Ford F150 
Pickup

2 12 $33.11 $12.55 Mighty $547.92 

2006 Chevrolet  
Impala

2 12 $31.57 $20.40 Mighty $623.64 
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2006 Chevy 
Colorado Pickup

1 6 $31.70 $16.30 Mighty $288.00 

2006 Dodge 
Charger

9 54 $36.52 $12.70 Mighty $2,657.88 

2006 Ford E350 
Van

1 6 $34.81 $11.50 Mighty $277.86 

2006 Crown Vic. 1 6 $33.11 $12.25 Mighty $272.16 

2006 Ford CP 1 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2006 Ford Truck 
250 

1 6 $36.52 $12.75 Mighty $295.62 

2006  150 
Supercrew

2 12 $33.11 $21.55 Mighty $655.92 

2007 Dodge 
Charger

12 72 $36.52 $12.75 Mighty $3,547.44 

2007 Chevrolet 
Silverado

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

Ford 350 
Passenger

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2007 Chevrolet 
Tahoe  

1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

2007 Ford 
Crown Vic.

1 6 $33.11 $7.28 Mighty $242.34 

2007 Dodge 
Durango

1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

2008 Ford F350 
Truck

1 6 $34.81 $17.85 Mighty $315.96 

2008 Dodge 
Charger

4 24 $36.52 $12.75 Mighty $1,182.48 

2008 Ford Truck 
F150

2 12 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $535.32 

2008 Ford Van 
E350

2 12 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $535.32 

2008 Truck 
Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500
2 12 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $535.32 

2008 Chevrolet 
Silverado 2500

1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2008 Crown 
Victoria

1 6 $33.11 $6.20 Mighty $235.86 

2008 Ford Truck 
F150

1 6 $33.11 $11.50 Mighty $267.66 

2008 Chevrolet. 
Truck F150

1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

2008 Dodge 
Durango

5 30 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $1,375.80 
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2009 Dodge 
Charger

18 108 $36.52 $12.75 Mighty $5,321.16 

2009 Chevrolet 
SUV Tahoe

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2009 Ford Van 2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2009 Chevrolet 
Silverado

2 12 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $550.32 

2009 Dodge 
Durango

1 6 $32.40 $12.75 Mighty $270.90 

2010 Dodge 
Charger

9 54 $36.52 $12.75 Mighty $2,660.58 

2010 SUV Jeep 
Grand Cherokee

1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

2010 Ford 
Crown Victoria

1 6 $33.11 $6.20 Mighty $235.86 

2010 SUV 
Chevrolet Tahoe

1 6 $33.11 $12.75 Mighty $275.16 

TOTAL $43,185.06

Signature of Approval Date
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