
A-1 Fire & 
Security

Firetrol 
Protection 
Systems

Davis Fire American 
Fire & Safety

A-1 Fire & 
Safety

Professionals 
of Texas Fire 

& Safety

Action Fire 
Pros

Automatic 
Fire and 

Protection

Protech Fire 
& Safety

Century Fire 
Protection

Inspection of Fire 
Extinguishers $6.50 $5.00 5.00 $4.00 $6.00 $4.00 $3.25 $7.50 $10.00 $4.00

5lb 78 $16.00 $28.00 13.00 $15.00 $14.00 $30.95 $20.00 $35.00 $25.00 No Bid

10lb 116 $16.00 $32.00 13.00 $15.00 $14.00 $36.95 $24.00 $35.00 $25.00 No Bid

Inspection of 
Fusible Links $9.95 $9.00 7.00 No Bid $8.00 $14.25 $7.50 $75.00 $12.50 $9.00

Annual Inspection 
of Sprinkler 

Systems
$595.00 $250.00 95.00 No Bid $115.00 $125.00

$1800/all Jail 
& Detention 
$600/Admin 

&SO 
$1200/Expo

$150/wet 
system 

$210/Dry 
System 

$380/Fire 
Pump

No Bid No Bid

Annual Fire Hose 
Inspection $55.00 $18.00 $13.00 $22.50 $8.00 $4.00 $35.00 $50.00 $12.50 $4.00

Semi Annual 
Suppression 

System
$95.00 $150.00 $55.00 

$65/1st 
cylinder 
$20/add'l 
cylinders

$60.00 $135.00 $150.00 $150.00 $95.00 $65.00

Replacement of 
Fusible Links $9.95 $9.00 $7.00 $8.50 $7.00 Included 

above $25.00 $10.00 $125.00 $9.00

Total $7,554.25 $8,150.00 $4,301.00 $4,734.00 $4,516.00 $8,017.30 $7,926.75 $11,162.50 $7,727.50 $1,110.00

Approved by Commissioner’s Court on this  day of 2011 by

holding the position of 

Hydro Testing of 
Portable 

Extinguishers

207

Quantity

4

1

43

1

1

RECOMMEND AWARD TO: Davis Fire

Fire Extinguisher and Sprinkler Inspections
Tabulation

October 1, 2011 - September 30, 2013


