Bid 2011-52 Aggregate for Surface Treatment

February 1, 2012 - January 31, 2013

Colorado Knife River RTI Materials Statewide Texas Aggregates TXI
Materials, LTD. Materials
Type B, Grade 3
Loaded S 12.00 | S 25.18 | S 14.00 | S 8751|S 9.50
Loaded and Hauled S 34.00 | $ 29.52 | S 18.00 | S 22.67
Product name 1-302, Gr-3 ¢/s Type B Grade 3 Sealcoat|Washed Gr 3 Grade 3 #67 Gravel
AQMP Class B Rock
Product number #1200 39269 n/a
Type B,Grade 4
Loaded S 10.00 | S 24.06 | S 14.00 | S 825(S 9.00
Loaded and Hauled S 32.00 (S 28.40 | S 18.00 | S 22.17
Product name 1-302, Gr-4 c/s Type B Grade 4 Sealcoat|Washed Gr 4 Grade 4 Gr 8 Gravel
AQMP Class B Rock
Product number #1210 39881 n/a
Type B, Grade 5
Loaded S 14.00 | S 27.74 | S 16.00 n/a
Loaded and Hauled S 36.00 | S 32.08 | S 18.00
Product name 1-302, Gr-5 ¢/s Type B Grade 5 Sealcoat|Washed Gr 5
Product number #1220 39680
Lightweight Aggregate
Type L, Grade 4
Loaded No bid n/a No bid n/a S 34.00
Loaded and Hauled No bid n/a No bid S 44.62
Product name TYLGr4
Product number
Plant Location Comal County Bryan Georgetown Bastrop Bastrop Streetman
Delivery 72 hour 15 days 3-5 days 60 days n/a as needed
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