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Award to:Express Employement Professionals           Approved by:__________________________________ Date____________

      * denotes did not bid on all positions

County Judge Randy Sims

TEMPORARY EMPLOYMENT SERVICES
BID TABULATION 2009-038

  JUNE 30, 2009 - JUNE 29, 2010

$6,624.00

HUMAN 
RESOURCE 

WITH 
INTERGRITY

$9.80

$9.80

$11.04

$6,708.00

$1,692.00

TOTAL HRS

$1,215.00

$4,860.00

$6,750.00

$1,687.50

$2,430.00

$1,380.00

$16.20

$11.04

$93.39 $30,991.50

TOTAL HRS

$979.00

$3,916.00

$75.42

CAREERS 
USA

$12.15

$12.15

$13.50

$14.85

$13.50

$10.67

TOTAL HRS

$1,030.00

$4,260.00

$5,325.00

$5,680.00

$1,420.00

$1,917.00

$17.28 $10,368.00

$3,910.50

$7,770.00

$12.78

No Bid

$26.07 $12.76

No Bid

$1,914.00

$5,280.00

$5,610.00

$1,683.00

$6,336.00

$16.16 $1,616.00

$7,684.00

$990.00

$3,960.00 $19.21

TOTAL HRSHUMAN 
RESOURCE 

CONNECTION* 

$9,500.00

$2,145.00

 TOTAL HRS 

$9,230.00

 TOTAL HRS 

$984.00

$3,936.00

$5,400.00

LABOR 
READY *

WILLSTAFF P.I.E 
MGMT 

$5,400.00

$1,428.75

$5,335.00

$5,335.00

$1,333.75

$11.284. Adm. Asst.

2. Clerk 

$14.30$9.791.Receptionist $1,184.00

$4,736.00

$6,660.00

$7,425.00$5,640.00

TOTAL

$10.567.Bldg./Grounds

6. Exec. Assistant $1,998.00

$7,452.00

$30,355.00

5. Accounting Clerk

$25,840.00$64.14$133.34

No Bid

$18,863.25$44,453.50$25,179.00

$11.18

3. Secretary $10.56

$11.22$13.32

$10.56

$11.22

 LINK 
STAFFING 

 EXPRESS 
EMPLOYMENT 
PROFF 

$9.90

 TOTAL HRS 

$9.90

$13.32

$12.42

$11.84

$11.84

$13.32

$6,660.00

$1,665.00

TOTAL HRS

$980.00

$3,920.00

 KELLY 
SERVICES* 

$9.84

$9.84

$10.80

$1,430.00

No Bid

$89.38 $73.92

$5,520.00

$13.32 $1,320.00

$11.36

Number of hours worked before hiring           320 hours       

$10.30

$10.65

$10.65

$67.10

$11.36

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8,712.00

$10,142.00

No Bid $12.95 $14.52

$28.82$26,582.75$77.30$19,632.00

DESCRIPTION HOURS

$10.67

No Bid

No Bid

$9.79

$10.67$18.46

$19.00 $10.80 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 TOTAL HRS 

$17.16 $11.43

$11.43 $1,714.50

$11.04

$11.28
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